
Mindsprint and GROW 

with SAP: Your Launchpad 

to Cloud ERP Excellence

Accelerate your SAP 

Transformation Journey 

with Mindsprint’s Baseline 

Package “Empower” for 

GROW with SAP.

Spr in t  in to  mindfu l  poss ib i l i t ies

A  M i n d s p r i n t  B r o c h u r e 



Having a scalable, secure, and future-ready 

ERP system is critical for businesses navigating 

the complexities of digital transformation. 

With deep expertise in SAP solutions, 

Mindsprint helps businesses accelerate 

implementation, optimize processes, and 

ensure seamless adoption. 

Whether starting fresh or migrating an existing 

system, we empower organizations to 

maximize their cloud ERP investment. GROW 

with SAP provides the agility and innovation to 

drive growth, and Mindsprint is the right 

partner to implement it.

The right ERP sets 
the foundation, but 

the right 
partner drives 
success.

Mindsprint

FUNCTIONAL 
MODULES

TECH
TRANSFORMATION

SOLUTIONS

Cloud ALM

Data management 

Customer experience

Integrations

Business Tech Platform (BTP)

Test Automation-Tricentis



Mindsprint's Key Capabilities for GROW

Get up and
running quickly with 
Mindsprint’s guided 
setup, fast technical 
configuration, and an 
intuitive, role-based 
interface.

Accelerated 
Implementation

Receive fully 
managed SAP 
updates without 
business disruption, 
ensuring continuous 
improvements.

Seamless
Updates

Enhance efficiency 
with built-in AI, 
machine learning, 
robotic process 
automation, and
real-time analytics.

AI-Driven
Innovation

Improve security 
operations with 
automated backups, 
disaster recovery,
and compliance 
management to ensure 
high service uptime.

Robust Security 
& Compliance

Business Outcomes of GROW

Value Proposition of GROW

Streamline 
procurement 
processes to reduce 
cycle times

Procurement

Real-time insights
for better decision-
making, and faster 
adaptation to 
market changes

CEO

Accelerate revenue 
recognition by 
streamlining order 
management 

Sales

Mitigate financial risks 
with access to single 
source of truth for 
financial data

Finance 

Enhance project control 
with easier structuring, 
planning, and staffing 
projects

Project Services

Improve supply chain 
visibility and production 
planning by optimizing 
inventory management 

Manufacturing

Enhance visibility into 
shipments with optimized 
labor, storage and 
fulfilment costs

Supply Chain

Mindsprint

Gain instant access
to real-time data and 
analytics within SAP 
S/4HANA Cloud Public
Edition or through
SAP Analytics
Cloud integration.

GET ACTIONABLE 
REAL-TIME INSIGHTS

Build tailored 
dashboards and 
reports using 
embedded analytics or 
SAP Analytics Cloud for 
informed decision-
making.

LEVERAGE 
CUSTOMIZABLE 
REPORTING

Extend functionality 
seamlessly with SAP 
BTP, allowing side-by-
side innovations without 
modifying core systems.

ENSURE SYSTEM 
INTEGRITY WITH A 
CLEAN CORE

Adapt effortlessly to 
evolving business needs 
with a cloud-based, 
scalable solution. 

ACHIEVE SCALABILITY 
& FLEXIBILITY



Drive transformation 
across business
functions with Mindsprint 
and S/4HANA GROW

Built specifically for the corporate segment seeking cloud ERP transformation, S/4HANA 

GROW offers a robust and scalable platform. Mindsprint's expertise facilitates a smooth 

and strategic migration, maximizing the potential of SAP Cloud ERP capabilities.

/ Financial Planning and
Analysis 

/ Accounting and
Financial Close

/ AP/AR Management

/ Compliance and Tax 
Management

/ Cash Journal

/ Revenue Recognition

Finance Manufacturing Services

Sales Procurement Supply Chain

/ Customer Order 
Management

/ Billing and Invoicing

/ Customer Returns

/ Price Management

/ Sales Rebate 
Management

/ Intercompany Processes

/ Credit and Debit Memo 
Requests

/ Customer Project 
Management

/ Resource Management

/ Service Management

/ Internal Project 
Management

/ Time Recording

/ Production Engineering

/ Production Planning

/ Production Order 
Management

/ Manufacturing Options
[Discreet/Process]

/ Quality Management

/ Operational 
Procurement

/ Sourcing

/ Supplier 
Management

/ Invoice Management

/ Inventory Management

/ Order Promising

/ Warehouse 
Management

/ Transportation 
Management

Mindsprint



Success Stories

Driving Business 

Efficiency and Growth 

with S/4HANA GROW 

Implementation

CHALLENGES

/ Lack of visibility across services lines

/ Insufficient resource utilization

/ Significant manual effort and delay

/ Lack of data-driven insights 

MINDSPRINT’S IMPACT

100%
visibility of 
resource 
utilization 

100%
system-based 
revenue 
recognition 

30-50%
acceleration in 
Month-end 
close 

Enhanced 
UI/UX 
experience for 
end users

Mindsprint



Awards & Recognitions

GET IN TOUCH 

SCAN
TO LEARN MORE

www.mindsprint.com

partnerships@mindsprint.com

Distinguished 
Champion of the Key 
Business Leader 

Best Foreign Exchange 
Solution Award Asia 

Business AI
SAP GTMKOM APAC

Next Gen BTP 
Innovator at SAP 
NOW SEA

SAP ALM Excellence 
Award INDUS

BPC - Best Enterprise
Performance 
Management Award

Outstanding Business 
Transformation Award 
for SAP Global 
Template



ABOUT

Mindsprint’s purpose is to reimagine business with 

talent, technology, and insights-driven services. 

With a proven record of enabling global 

organizations in their business and technology 

transformation journey, Mindsprint is a leading 

provider of purpose-built, industry-first digital 

solutions and services.  

As an SAP Gold Partner and customer, Mindsprint 

offers a comprehensive range of SAP 

transformation services, including consulting, 

implementation, Partner Managed Cloud (PMC), 

and managed services. Leveraging a 360-degree 

relationship with SAP, we deliver accelerators and 

pre-configured solutions to empower customers 

in their RISE and GROW journeys.  Through our 

SAP Business AI services, we help organizations 

automate and optimize their business processes 

and improve customer experience.

Our expertise spans AI & Data Analytics, Cloud-

Native Development, Generative AI, SAP 

Transformation, Business Process Automation, 

Cybersecurity, and Product Engineering. Whether 

streamlining supply chains, enhancing customer 

experiences, or enabling smarter decision-

making, we deliver impactful, industry-first digital 

solutions. 

Headquartered in Singapore, with offices in India 

(Chennai & Bengaluru), the U.S., Australia and the 

U.K., Mindsprint is proud to be a Great Place to 

Work Certified  company, fostering a culture of 

innovation and collaboration.

V
IS

IT
 U

S For more information visit our website

Learn more about our SAP Practices 

Follow us on

https://www.mindsprint.com/
https://www.mindsprint.com/services/technology-services.html
https://www.youtube.com/@Mindsprint_Globl
https://x.com/MindsprintGlobl
https://www.linkedin.com/company/mindsprint/?viewAsMember=true
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